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Established in 2007, HYMERI in Pristina, 
Kosovo, excels as a KLEEMANN GROUP 
authorized partner, specializing in eleva-
tors and escalators. Offering sales,  
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installation, maintenance, and modern-
ization services, HYMERI, with a sea-
soned team and streamlined operations, 
is dedicated to top-notch vertical trans-
portation solutions.

Hymeri faced challenges including data 
silos, hindering seamless tracking across 
disparate IT systems, and a lack of reli-
able real-time data due to communica-
tion protocol issues with elevator boards 
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causing customer inconvenience. The 
implementation of a new IT system was 
complex, requiring coordination among 
multiple vendors and company depart-
ments.
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To overcome these challenges, Hymeri 
implemented a comprehensive IT solu-
tion,incorporating:

1. Integration of PBX call center: Agents 
can automatically access client informa-
tion based on phone numbers, saving 
time and providing a complete customer 
overview.

2. Integration of Navision: Data synchro-
nization between Navision and FMS 
ensures up-to-date and accurate in for 
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mation across the organization.

3. Integration of low-level communica-
tion protocol with elevators: Real-time 
communication with elevator boards 
provides valuable status data, enabling 
quicker troubleshooting. 

4. Creation of a mobile app: A mobile 
app for on-site employees facilitates 
real-time elevator status checks, prob-
lem reporting, and maintenance activity 
tracking.

Hymeri's solutions delivered:

1. Swift Customer Service Response: 
Achieved a remarkable 50% reduction in 
response time, ensuring quicker issue 
resolution.
2. Decreased Elevator Outages: Realized 
a notable 20% reduction, enhancing over-
all system reliability.

Impact
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3. Cost-efficient Repairs: Successfully 
cut costs by 10%, demonstrating effec-
tive maintenance measures.
4. Enhanced Overall Efficiency: Experi-
enced a commendable 15% improvement, 
reflecting the positive impact of imple-
mented solutions.

FMS has significantly improved Hymeri's 
efficiency, boosting customer satisfac-
tion and providing valuable business 
insights. This success underscores FMS's 
effectiveness as a crucial asset for Hym-
eri's evolution into a more customer-cen-

trik and efficient entity. The achievement 
also highlights GlobalCT's commitment 
to innovative, transformative solutions, 
making them an ideal partner for collabo-
rative and visionary projects.


